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PURPOSE AND NEED FOR ACTION: 
 
In Mississippi, access to public sporting clay ranges has not kept pace with the demand for safe, 
quality shooting opportunities for enthusiasts to pursue the sport. The Mississippi Department of 
Wildlife, Fisheries, and Parks (MDWFP) operates and maintains only three public shooting 
facilities in the entire state.  The McIvor Shooting Facility (North MS), Turcotte Shooting 
Facility (Central MS), and McHenry Shooting Facility (South MS). Of the three, McIvor and 
Turcotte Facilities have sporting clay trail ranges.  McHenry Shooting Facility in Stone County 
in extreme southeastern Mississippi is located to provide access to residents in the large 
population center of the three coastal counties (~ 370,000 population). The closest agency 
sporting clay range, Turcotte, lies over 150 miles away from most residents in this area. There is 
a need to make shooting opportunities (sporting clay) more accessible for them. 
 
Therefore, it our purpose to: 

• Provide a safe, quality, clean, and family friendly sporting clay trail at McHenry Shooting 
Facility.   

• Provide more educational and shooting range facilities to support classroom training and 
live fire opportunities for Hunter Education classes.   

• Support the expansion of programs that will encourage participation in shooting sports 
and hunting. 

 

PROPOSED ACTION 

The MDWFP proposes to construct a sporting clay trail at the existing McHenry Shooting 
Facility located on a property hereafter referred to as the “McHenry Tract.”  The trail will mirror 
sporting clay trails located at MDWFP (Turcotte and McIvor Shooting Facilities).  The trail will 
encompass the southern end of the McHenry Shooting Facility. 
 
The trail will be approximately 1 mile long.  Trail work will include grubbing, stumpage, and 
additional dirt work.  Dirt work will encompass grading, crowning, and ditching to create a 8- 
foot wide trail with a one-to-two foot crown.  Onsite material from ditching will be used for 
shaping trail.  Additional fill material will come from an onsite borrow area.  Trail surface will 
include approximately 4” of aggregate.  Trail aggregate will have a 3” overlay of asphalt. 
 
In addition to the trail a levee will be constructed to provide an approximate 3-acre pond in an 
area already impounded by beaver dams.  The levee will include drainage pipe and emergency 
spillway.  Onsite material will be used to construct levee.  All graded and scarred areas will be 
seeded and mulched to minimize erosion. 
 
Along the path of the trail 12 predetermined locations will be identified for shooting stations.  
Each shooting station will include shooting platforms and safety fencing.  Sporting clay 
machines will be purchased to propel sporting clay targets at each station.  Signage will be 
purchased to identify trail route and shooting stations. 



 
We estimate a total of 5,474 cubic yards of fill will be excavated from the onsite borrow pit. No 
fill will be excavated offsite.   
 
The proposed Sporting Clay Trail would occur on the existing McHenry Shooting Facility 
located in Stone County, Mississippi.  The existing Facility is located 1060 East McHenry Road 
McHenry, MS  39561.  The proposed trail is located at section 13/T4S/R11 West in Stone 
County, Mississippi (see attached map showing the location of proposed sporting clay trail). 
See APPENDIX ONE for the site plan for the proposed action. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
LEGAL DESCRIPTIONS OF TRACTS/EASEMENTS: 
 
McHenry Tract 
 

 



 



 

 

  



PUBLIC INVOLVEMENT: 

Public input for the proposed activity will be solicited through notices placed on MDWFP’s 
website and in the state-wide newspaper, the Clarion Ledger, for a period of 30 days. 
Respondents will be given the option of submitting comments via email. 

 

ALTERNATIVES: 

Preferred Action 

The preferred action proposed here consists of construction of a sporting clay trail on the existing 
McHenry Shooting Facility.  The trail will mirror sporting clay trails located at MDWFP 
(Turcotte and McIvor Shooting Facilities).  The trail will encompass the southern end of the 
McHenry Shooting Facility. 
 
The trail will be approximately 1 mile long.  Trail work will include grubbing, stumpage, and 
additional dirt work.  Dirt work will encompass grading, crowning, and ditching to create a 8- 
foot wide trail with a one-to-two foot crown.  Onsite material from ditching will be used for 
shaping trail.  Additional fill material will come from an onsite borrow area.  Trail surface will 
include approximately 4” of aggregate.  Trail aggregate will have a 3” overlay of asphalt. 
 
In addition to the trail a levee will be constructed to provide an approximate 3-acre pond in an 
area already inundated by beaver dams.  The levee will include drainage pipe and emergency 
spillway.  Onsite material will be used to construct levee.  All graded and scarred areas will be 
seeded and mulched to minimize erosion. 
 
Along the path of the trail 12 predetermined locations will be identified for shooting stations.  
Each shooting station will include shooting platforms and safety fencing.  Sporting clay 
machines will be purchased to propel sporting clay targets at each station.  Signage will be 
purchased to identify trail route and shooting stations. 
 
We estimate a total of 5,474 cubic yards of fill will be excavated from the onsite borrow pit. No 
fill will be excavated offsite. 
 

No Action Alternative 

The “No Action Alternative” identified here would consist of maintaining the McHenry Shooting 
Facility as is.  In this scenario, no federal or state dollars would be expended and there would be 
no further construction disturbance to existing habitats. However, the potential for additional 
public outdoor recreational opportunities and additional opportunities for target practice and 
marksmanship training at public target ranges would not be realized. 

 



AFFECTED ENVIRONMENT  

The McHenry Tract upon which the proposed construction would occur is located within Stone 
County, Mississippi, approximately 12 miles from the City of Wiggins, the County’s main 
population center. The tract is located within Mississippi’s East Gulf Coastal Plain Ecoregion 
(Mississppi State Wildlife Action Plan). 

Soils and Topography 

There are two hydric soil types found within the McHenry Tract: Smithton fine sandy loam, 
which is located along a stream or hollow that runs through the southern portion of the tract, and 
Atmore loam, which is located within a patch near the southwestern corner of the tract.  
Additional soil types found within the tract include Malbis fine sandy loam, McLaurin fine sandy 
loam and Saucier fine sandy loam. 

 

Air Quality 

Stone County, Mississippi is classified as “Attainment/Unclassifiable” for all categories 
measured under 40 CFR § 81.325 with the exception of Categories “TSP” and “Sulfur Dioxide 
NAAQS” for which it is classified as “Better than National Standards.” 

Geological Resources 

The State of Mississippi is within the Gulf Coastal Plain Physiographic Province and is further 
divided into twelve physiographic districts. Copiah County is located within the Piney Woods 
Physiographic District, which itself is divided into upland areas, intermediate or rolling hill areas 
and lowland areas (Mississippi Geological, Economic, and Topographical Survey). 
 
Stone County lies within the portion of Mississippi where a transition occurs between the non-
marine deposits of the Hattiesburg Formation and the estuarine to marine deposits of the 
Pascagoula Formation. The precise relations between these units are not yet clearly defined. 
They are difficult to discriminate either in the field or in subsurface studies, largely because they 
are mostly composed of silty to clayey sediments of similar character and contain few fossils. 
Some fossil wood has been found in both units, and some shell accumulations of Miocene age 
have been found in the Pascagoula Formation in Jackson County. In Stone County, these 
deposits vary from light bluish gray to medium olive. They contain some lenses and beds of fine 



sand and some beds of swelling clays that range from 6 inches to 5 feet. These deposits are 
mostly impermeable and therefore subject to extensive sheet wash during storms. Soils on slopes 
underlain by the Hattiesburg and Pascagoula Formations commonly have profiles that are less 
than 1 foot in thickness. The contact between these deposits and those of the "Citronelle 
Formation," which typically is the unit deposited on top of them, varies widely in elevation. In 
parts of Stone County, these clayey units underlie the highest hills at an average of 400 ft. 
 
Water Resources 
 
Two small, man-made impoundments exist on the McHenry Tract. With the construction 
proposed here, a stretch of a tributary to the stream system, Boggy Branch currently impounded 
by beaver dams would additionally be impounded through construction of a levee at its southern-
most end. The levee will allow for the trail to cross the present impounded area. A spillway or 
culvert will be constructed to maintain flow to Boggy Branch and the associated small stream 
swamp forest located immediately downstream. 
 
Floodplains and Wetlands 
 
Two are. The entirety of the McHenry Tract is designated as a floodplain, specifically, as a 
Category X Floodplain characterized by the Federal Emergency Management Agency has having 
moderate to minimal risk of flooding. 
 
Archeological, Historical, and Cultural Resources 
 
Pursuant to Section 106 of the National Historic Preservation Act, a review of the McHenry 
Tract and proposed activities was requested from Mississippi’s State Historic Preservation Office 
(SHPO), the Mississippi Department of Archives and History.  Results of a cultural resources 
survey conducted on the McHenry Tract are found in APPENDIX TWO.  

Recreation 

The McHenry Tract is operated at MDWFP’s McHenry Shooting Facility and recreation that 
occurs on the property is entirely associated with shooting sports. Current options available to 
the public include a pistol range, rifle ranges, shotgun patterning range, trap range, five-stand 
sporting clay field, and a 3-D archery range. 

EXPECTED ENVIRONMENTAL EFFECTS 

Soils and Topography 

No significant impacts are expected from the proposed action. 

Air Quality 

No significant impacts are expected from the proposed action. 

Geological Resources 

No significant impacts are expected from the proposed action. 



Water Resources 
 
No effects are expected for the two small, man-made impoundments exist on the McHenry Tract. 
With the construction proposed here, a stretch of a tributary to the stream system, Boggy Branch 
currently impounded by beaver dams would additionally be impounded through construction of a 
levee at its southern-most end. The levee will allow for the trail to cross the present impounded 
area. A spillway or culvert will be constructed to maintain flow to Boggy Branch and the 
associated small stream swamp forest located immediately downstream. 
 
Floodplains and Wetlands 
 
Project area has been surveyed for occurrence of the wetland plant Louisiana Quillwort (Listed 
Endangered) according to standard survey methodologies in anticipation of the proposed project. 
The species was not detected in the project area. Suitable habitat is not found in the construction 
zone; the area is impounded by beavers. Suitable Louisiana Quillwort habitat does exist 
downstream of the proposed pond in the form of shaded small stream swamp forest. Best 
management practices for preventing sedimentation from entering the watershed and affecting 
the downstream habitat will be employed during construction. Flow to the downstream habitat 
will be maintained. Furthermore, we will conduct a follow-up survey of this area during the 
winter when Louisiana Quillwort is more detectable. If the species is present, a burn plan for 
preventing shrub encroachment will be implemented. Mechanical techniques for preventing 
shrub encroachment would not be employed. 
 
Archeological, Historical, and Cultural Resources 
 
The SHPO review concluded that no cultural resources were likely to be affected by the 
proposed activities and there were no objections to the proposed activities. The SHPO response 
letter is attached as APPENDIX TWO. 

 

Recreation 

Recreational opportunities at MDWFP’s McHenry Shooting Facility will be expanded with the 
addition of the sporting clay trail proposed for construction here. 

 

SOCIO-ECONOMIC RESOURCES 

Population 

As of 1 July 2019, the United States Census Bureau estimates the population of Stone County to 
be 18,336.  Stone is mostly rural with the main population center being Wiggins, Mississippi 
(pop. 4,552). 

Employment 



As of 1 July 2019, the United States Census Bureau estimates the civilian employed population 
of Stone County to be 10,195.  

Income 

Using data collected between 2014 and 2018 the United States Census Bureau estimates the 
median household income for Stone County to be $44,883 and per capita income to be $21,931. 

 

BIOLOGICAL ENVIRONMENT 

Vegetation 

A floral survey of the McHenry Tract was conducted by MDWFP’s botanist on 21 July 2020 for 
the purposes of this environmental assessment. A qualitative ground survey was conducted in the 
area of the proposed pond/lake, with the entirety of the tributary on the property examined.  

 A purpose of this survey was to determine if Louisiana quillwort (Isoestes louisianensis) might 
be present in the area of a proposed pond/lake as part of the proposed sporting clay trail. Isoetes 
louisianensis is listed as Endangered in the United States Endangered Species Act. It has a state 
rank of S2 and a global rank of G2G3. A qualitative ground survey was conducted in the area of 
the proposed pond/lake, with the entirety of the tributary on the property examined. The timing 
of the survey was during the time of senescence of the species, which is typically present in the 
late fall through the winter months. Therefore, the habitat was evaluated to determine suitability 
for the species. 

The western branch of the tributary has two beaver impoundments (labeled A and B in Figure 2). 
The upper beaver impoundment has remnants of an old pitcher plant bog near the existing dam 
of a small lake. Yellow pitcherplant (Sarracenia alata), whitehead bogbutton (Lachnocaulon 
anceps), Sphagnum sp., tenangle pipewort (Eriocaulon decangulare) were all observed. This is a 
depauperate bog due to the shading of swamp black gum (Nyssa biflora) and sweetbay magnolia 
(Magnolia virginiana), swamp titi (Cyrilla racemiflora), and buckwheat tree (Cliftonia 
monophylla). This area, which represents the area of proposed construction is unlikely to have 
Isoetes louisianensis as the habitat is not suitable. 

Suitable habitat for Isoetes Louisianensis is present on the McHenry Tract downstream of the 
proposed construction area. Although no plants were found, further surveys will be carried out 
during the plant’s growing season to document presence or absence and the habitat in this area 
will be maintained. 

Wildlife and Fisheries 

Recreational hunting and fishing do not occur on the McHenry Tract, operated as MDWFP’s 
McHenry Shooting Facility. Therefore, our data and survey efforts pertain species designated by 
the United States Fish and Wildlife Service (USFWS) as “Endangered” or “Threatened.”  

See “APPENDIX THREE” for our Section 7 Consultation with the USFWS regarding 
Endangered and Threatened Species. 



 

ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY 

Sound 

A noise study was conducted in 2012 prior to construction of the McHenry Shooting Facility to 
assess the potential for noise disturbance to the area resulting from operation of the McHenry 
Tract as a shooting facility. The report resulting from that study is attached as APPENDIX 
FOUR. 

Introduction of Toxic Substances: Lead Management 

The MDWFP uses best management practices for lead at outdoor shooting ranges established by 
the United States Environmental Protection Agency for managing lead introduced to the 
environment (https://www.epa.gov/sites/production/files/documents/epa_bmp.pdf) at its 
McHenry Shooting Facility. These would be extended to the design and operation of the 
proposed sporting clay trail. Mitigating measures taken at the facility include: 

1. Erosion control and storm water management techniques will be utilized throughout 
construction and the expected life of the range. 

2. Soil and runoff pH will be tracked through semi-annual monitoring and adjust the amount of 
lime applied to different areas of the range to maintain a pH level that will prevent lead from 
dissolving (i.e., a pH of 6.5 - 8.5). 

3. Vegetation and sparse grass area on the trap/skeet field will prevent runoff of lead pellets. 

4. Lead will be reclaimed/recovered/recycled from the shot field area/berm at such time when it 
becomes economically feasible. 

5. The soil on the range is predominantly silt/clay and will be both in and strategically placed in 
the shot fall/berm area. Lead tends to cling tightly to clay soil particulates reducing the potential 
to affect other organisms. 

6. Trap field/shooting range will be oriented to avoid lead shot entering wetlands. 

Public Health or Safety 

Range design was developed by MDWFP engineering staff (Attachment 2).  All berms and other 
safety considerations will be constructed in accordance with design standards set forth in the 
NRA Sourcebook, the 3rd and 4th National Shooting Sports Symposiums and the National 
Association of Shooting Ranges. All use areas will be compliant with ADA requirements. 
Skeet/Trap will be oriented toward the North.    Skeet/Trap/Sporting Clay ranges will be oriented 
so that all shot fall goes to a center location.  All rifle/pistol ranges will be constructed as a “no 
blue sky” range and will be fitted with baffles that will block any projectile from leaving the site. 
The perimeter will be fenced and posted with signs indicating that the area is a firing range. The 
nearest resident to the east is over 6 tenths of a mile. 



The Proposed Action provides a benefit to public safety by providing a safe place for residents in 
northern Mississippi to practice shooting their firearms.   The facility is designed in order to 
provide a safe environment where MDWFP administered safety classes will be conducted.  
Safety Features, such as berms, baffles, and backstops, will be incorporated into the design of the 
shooting ranges to ensure the safety of the community utilizing the facility.  All use areas will be 
compliant with ADA requirements. 

CONCLUSIONS 

The MDWFP believes that the construction and operation of the proposed sporting clay trail at 
our existing McHenry Shooting Facility will not have a significant effect on the environment and 
will result in a positive overall impact. Based on the proposed actions and site topology, minimal 
land disturbance will be required for the project. Additionally, the implementation of the new 
range will promote community awareness, stewardship, shooting safety, and environmental 
awareness. 
  



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

APPENDIX ONE: Site Plan for Proposed Activities 
  



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

McHenry Sporting Clay Trail (Aerial) 

 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

APPENDIX TWO: Cultural Resources 
  



















 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

APPENDIX THREE: ESA Section 7 Consultation 
  



REGION 4 
 INTRA-SERVICE SECTION 7 BIOLOGICAL EVALUATION FORM 
 
Originating Person:     Matt E. Roberts                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     
 
Telephone Number:     601-559-7415                     E-Mail:     matt.roberts@wfp.ms.gov                                                                     
 
Date:     13 July 2020                                            
 
PROJECT NAME (Grant Title/Number):  McHenry Shooting Facility Sporting Clay Trail 
 
I. Service Program: Federal Aid 
         Clean Vessel Act 

       Coastal Wetlands 
       Endangered Species Section 6 
       Partnerships for Wildlife 
       Sport Fish Restoration 
  X  Wildlife Restoration 

         Farm Bill Section 390 
 

II. State/Agency: Mississippi Department of Wildlife, Fisheries, and Parks 
 
III. Station Name:  Law Enforcement Bureau 
 
IV. Description of Proposed Action (attach additional pages as needed): Please see 

attached project narrative. 
  



 
 
V. Pertinent Species and Habitat: 
 

A. Include species/habitat occurrence map: Gopher Tortoise (A), Black Pinesnake 
(B), and Louisiana Quillwort (C). 

 

 
 
 

 
 B. Complete the following table: 
 

SPECIES/CRITICAL HABITAT STATUS1 

Gopher Tortoise T 

Black Pine Snake T 
Louisiana Quillwort E 

    
1STATUS: E=endangered, T=threatened, PE=proposed endangered, PT=proposed threatened, CH=critical habitat, 

PCH=proposed critical habitat, C=candidate species 



VI. Location (attach map): Please see attached project narrative with maps. 
 

A. Ecoregion Number and Name: 
 

B.   County and State:  Stone County, Mississippi 
 

C.   Section, township, and range (or latitude and longitude):  
  
  
D.   Distance (miles) and direction to nearest town: 
  
  
 
E. Species/habitat occurrence: Records for Gopher Tortoise, Black Pinesnake, and 

Louisiana Quillwort occur within two miles of the project area. No records of 
these species occur from the property itself. 

 
VII. Determination of Effects: 
 

A. Explanation of effects of the action on species and critical habitats in item V. 
B (attach additional pages as needed): 

 
SPECIES/ 

CRITICAL HABITAT 
IMPACTS TO SPECIES/CRITICAL HABITAT 

Gopher Tortoise 

Reported to occur within two miles of the project area. If Gopher 
Tortoises occur within the project area and no measures are taken to 
minimize impact, individuals could be harmed or killed during 
construction.  

Black Pinesnake 

Reported to occur within two miles of the project area. If Black 
Pinesnakes occur within the project area and no measures are taken 
to minimize impact, individuals could be harmed or killed during 
construction. 

Louisiana Quillwort 
Reported to occur within two miles of the project area. If this species 
occurs within the project area and no measures are taken to 
minimize impact, it could be harmed or killed during construction. 

 
  



B. Explanation of actions to be implemented to reduce adverse effects: 
 

SPECIES/ 
CRITICAL HABITAT 

ACTIONS TO MITIGATE/MINIMIZE IMPACTS 

Gopher Tortoise 

Project area has been surveyed for occurrence of Gopher Tortoises 
according to standard survey methodologies in anticipation of the 
proposed project. No Gopher Tortoises were detected in the project 
area. If Gopher Tortoises are detected later during construction, they 
will be relocated out of harm’s way in collaboration with USFWS. 

Black Pinesnake 

Project area has been surveyed for occurrence of Black Pinesnakes 
according to standard survey methodologies in anticipation of the 
proposed project. No Black Pinesnakes were detected in the project 
area. If Black Pinesnakes are detected later during construction, they 
will be relocated out of harm’s way in collaboration with USFWS. 

Louisiana Quillwort 

Project area has been surveyed for occurrence of Louisiana 
Quillwort according to standard survey methodologies in 
anticipation of the proposed project. The species was not detected in 
the project area. Suitable habitat is not found in the construction 
zone; the area is impounded by beavers. Suitable Louisiana 
Quillwort habitat does exist downstream of the proposed pond in the 
form of shaded small stream swamp forest. Best management 
practices for preventing sedimentation from entering the watershed 
and affecting the downstream habitat will be employed during 
construction. Flow to the downstream habitat will be maintained. 
Furthermore, we will conduct a follow-up survey of this area during 
the winter when Louisiana Quillwort is more detectable. If the 
species is present, a burn plan for preventing shrub encroachment 
will be implemented. Mechanical techniques for preventing shrub 
encroachment would not be employed. 

 
 
 
VIII. Effect Determination and Response Requested: 

 
SPECIES/ 

CRITICAL HABITAT 
DETERMINATION1 RESPONSE1 

REQUESTED 
 NE NA AA  

Gopher Tortoise  X  Concurrence 
Black Pinesnake  X  Concurrence 
Louisiana Quillwort  X  Concurrence 

     



     
     

1DETERMINATION/RESPONSE REQUESTED: 
NE = no effect.  This determination is appropriate when the proposed action will not directly, indirectly, or cumulatively impact, either 
positively or negatively, any listed, proposed, candidate species or designated/proposed critical habitat.  Response Requested is 
optional but a “Concurrence” is recommended for a complete Administrative Record. 

 
NA = not likely to adversely affect.  This determination is appropriate when the proposed action is not likely to adversely impact any 
listed, proposed, candidate species or designated/proposed critical habitat or there may be beneficial effects to these resources.  
Response Requested is a “Concurrence”. 

 
AA = likely to adversely affect.  This determination is appropriate when the proposed action is likely to adversely impact any listed, 
proposed, candidate species or designated/proposed critical habitat.  Response Requested for listed species is “Formal Consultation”.  
Response Requested for proposed or candidate species is “Conference”. 

 
                                                          _______________           
signature (State Representative) date 

 
 __________________________                                                      
title 

 
IX.  Reviewing Division of Federal Aid Staff Evaluation:  
 

A.  Concurrence              Nonconcurrence _____    
 

B.  ESA Section 7 Coordinator Consulted        
 
 C.  Remarks (attach additional pages as needed): 
 
 
 
 
 
 

                                                                          ___________________________   
signature     date 
                                                            __________________________________                                                               

 title      office 
 
X.  Reviewing Ecological Services Office Evaluation:  
 

A.  Concurrence              Nonconcurrence _____ 
 
B.  Formal consultation required _____           

 
C.  Conference required _____            

 
D.  Informal conference required _____            

 
E. Remarks (attach additional pages as needed):   
 

7/13/2020

Director of Grants Management

x



                                                                          ___________________________   
signature     date 
                                                            __________________________________                                                               

 title      office 
 
XI.  Chief -- Division of Federal Aid:  
 

A.  Concurrence _____ Nonconcurrence _____             
 

                                                                ________________________________                                                              
 signature      date 
 

07/14/2020

Assistant Field Supervisor Mississippi ES FO



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

APPENDIX FOUR: Noise Study 

 
























